AUTOMATED RESIDENTIAL CURBSIDE REFUSE COLLECTION SERVICES

Bid No. 4, 2011-12
Bid Tabulation Worksheet

6-Jun-12

ltem Multiplier
Item A - Curbside Automated Trash Collection
2012-13 9217
2013-14 9217
2014-15 9217
Item B - Bulk
2012-13 4385
2013-14 4385
2014-15 4385
Item C - Televisions
2012-13 370
2013-14 370
2014-15 370
Item D - Downtown Business District Litter Barrel Collection
2012-15 3
Item E - Town Owned/Operated Facilities Containers and Collection
2012-15 3
Item F - Board of Education Buildings Containers and Collection
2012-15 3
Total
Automated Recycling Collection Service
Bid No. 5, 2011-12
Bid Tabulation Worksheet
6-Jun-12

ltem [ Multiplier |
Iltem A - Curbside Private Dwelling Single Stream Automated Collection (3 Units or Less) (Annual Cost pel
2012-13 9,217
2013-14 9,217
2014-15 9,217
Iltem B - Condominium Complex Single Stream Automated Collection (Annual Cost per Dwelling Unit)
2012-13 488
2013-14 488
2014-15 488

Iltem C - Condominium & Elderly Housing Single Stream Dumpster Collection (Annual Cost per Dumpster

2012-15

129

Item D - Collection of Oversized Metal Items (per Pickup)




2012-15 714
2012-15 288
Item E - Town Landfill/Recycling Center (Annual Cost)
2012-15 3
Item F - Town Hall (Annual Cost per Dumpster)
2012-15 6
Item G - Newington High School (Annual Cost per Dumpster)
2012-15 6
Iltem H - Middle & Elementary Schools (Annual Cost per Dumpster)
2012-15 18
Item | - Highway Department (Annual Cost)
2012-15 3
Total
Residential Condominium and Elderly Housing RefuseCollection Service
Bid No. 6, 2011-12
Bid Tabulation Worksheet
6-Jun-12

Item Multiplier
Item A - Four Cubic Yard Sized Containers, Unit Price per Year (Annual Collection Cost per Container
2012-15 6
Item B - Six Cubic Yard Sized Containers, Unit Price per Year (Annual Collection Cost per Container)
2012-15 309
Item C - Eight Cubic Yard Sized Containers, Unit Price per Year (Annual Collection Cost per Container
2012-15 99

Total




Bidder Bidder Bidder
Trash-Away CWPM All-Waste
Bid Amount Iltem Total Bid Amount Item Total Bid Amount
$68.52| $ 631,548.84 $ 81.37 | $ 749,987.29 NO BID
$69.00| $ 635,973.00 $ 82.18 | $ 757,453.06 NO BID
$70.56| $ 650,351.52 $ 83.00 | $ 765,011.00 NO BID
$10.50| $ 46,042.50 $ 25.00| $ 109,625.00 NO BID
$10.50| $ 46,042.50 $ 25.25|$ 110,721.25 NO BID
$10.50| $ 46,042.50 $ 2550 | $ 111,817.50 NO BID
$11.00| $ 4,070.00 $ 10.00 | $ 3,700.00 NO BID
$11.00| $ 4,070.00 $ 10.10 | $ 3,737.00 NO BID
$11.00| $ 4,070.00 $ 10.20 | $ 3,774.00 NO BID
$2,600.00] $ 7,800.00 $ 1,200.00 | $ 3,600.00 NO BID
$19,896.00| $ 59,688.00 $ 30,189.00 | $ 90,567.00 NO BID
$42,228.00| $ 126,684.00 $ 80,360.00 | $ 241,080.00 NO BID
$ 2,262,382.86 $ 2,951,073.10 NO BID
| Bidder | Bidder Bidder
TRASH-AWAY CWPM ALL-WASTE
[ Bid Amount [  Item Total Bid Amount ltem Total Bid Amount
- Dwelling Unit)
$ 26.52 | $ 244,434.84 $ 2572 |$ 237,061.24 NO BID
$ 27.00 | $ 248,859.00 $ 2597 | $ 239,365.49 NO BID
$ 2760 | $ 254,389.20 $ 26.23|$ 241,761.91 NO BID
$ 2652 | $ 12,941.76 $ 2572 | $ 12,551.36 NO BID
$ 27.00 | $ 13,176.00 $ 2597 | $ 12,673.36 NO BID
$ 2760 | $ 13,468.80 $ 26.23 | $ 12,800.24 NO BID
)
$ 780.00 | $ 100,620.00 $ 1,140.00|$ 147,060.00 NO BID




$ 11.00 | $ 7,854.00 $ 10.00 | $ 7,140.00 NO BID
$ 5.00 [ $ 1,440.00 $ 5.00 [ $ 1,440.00 NO BID
$ 780.00 | $ 2,340.00 $ 1,140.00 | $ 3,420.00 NO BID
$ 780.00 | $ 4,680.00 $ 1,140.00 | $ 6,840.00 NO BID
$ 780.00 | $ 4,680.00 $ 1,140.00 | $ 6,840.00 NO BID
$ 780.00 | $ 14,040.00 $ 1,140.00|$ 20,520.00 NO BID
$ 780.00 | $ 2,340.00 $ 1,140.00 | $ 3,420.00 NO BID
$ 925,263.60 $ 952,893.60 NO BID
[ Bidder | Bidder Bidder |
TRASH-AWAY CWPM ALL-WASTE
Bid Amount Item Total Bid Amount Item Total Bid Amount
0 0 $ 1,019.20 | $ 6,115.20 $ 936.00
0 0 $ 152880 % 472,399.20 $ 1,404.00
0 0 $ 2,03840|$ 201,801.60 $ 1,872.00
NO BID 0 $ 680,316.00







Bidder |

HQ DUMPSTERS

Item Total Bid Amouny Item Total
$ 5,616.00 $ 32656 |$ 1,959.36
$433,836.00 $ 492.96 | $152,324.64
$185,328.00 $ 657.28 | $ 65,070.72
$624,780.00 $219,354.72




